BID TABULATION

ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT

1 2 3 4 5
ALLEY-CASSETTY
COMPANIES INC.,
DESCRIPTION ADVANCED MOWER ADVQg&EistES ALABANéA(‘)LADDER ALABQEI\QCII\CA:SWER DBA OTTAWA
' TRUCK CENTER OF
Al ARAMA
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands In this
category
SECTION A-1 |2 Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
SECTION A-2 |3, parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
SECTION A-3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SECTION A-4

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $85.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $85.00
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 0%

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

10% WITH $25 MAX

NO BID

NO BID

$100.00

$100.00

BULK ORDER DIISCOUNT]

NA

NO BID



mailto:lindseyc@jccal.org

5

COMPANIES INC.,

DESCRIPTION ADVANCED MOWER ADV'CAONISEAS‘L?RES ALABAI\/(I:A(\)LADDER ALAB?EI\IQCII\éSWER DBA OTTAWA
; TRUCK CENTER OF
Al ABAMA
NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic) $95.00 $100.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $95.00 $100.00
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 10 RETAIL BULD DISC.
SECTION A-5 NO BID
NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 10% WITH $25 MAX NA
5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA NA
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star) NA NA
Equipment Manufacturer's: NA NA
NA NA NA




BID TABULATION

ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

6
DESCRIPTION ALTEC
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this
category
SECTION A-1 2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $136.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $136.00
SECTION A-2 |3, Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

- ________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________.
ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT

5% WITH $2.00 MAX

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

SECTION A-3 3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NOBID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
WQLJ”D“/IE’\”-—
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $136.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $136.00
SECTION A-4
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

5% WITH $2.00 MAX



mailto:lindseyc@jccal.org

—_—

DESCRIPTION ALTEC

NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic)

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

SECTION A-5 NO BID

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star)

Equipment Manufacturer's: NA




BID TABULATION

ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

10% WITH $25 MAX

7 8 9 10 11
AMERICAN
REFUELER ATMAX EQUIPMENT BRIDGESTONE
DESCRIPTION BATTERIES PL BRANNON HONDA
EQUIPMENT CO., CO. HOSEPOWER LLC S PLUS = o
INC.
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this
category $165.00
SECTION A-1 |2 Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $165.00
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 9% WITH $38 MAX
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
SECTION A-2 |3, Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
. _________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ _____________________________________________________________________________|
ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
SECTION A-3 - - - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
. _________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________| . __________________________ ______________________|
OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $145.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $145.00
SECTION A-4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 10%
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7 8 9 10 11
AMERICAN
REFUELER ATMAX EQUIPMENT BRIDGESTONE
DESCRIPTION
SC o EQUIPMENT CO., Co. HOSEPOWER LLC BATTERIES PLUS | BRANNON HONDA
INC.
NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic) $128.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $128.00
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA
SECTION A-5 NA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
NA
5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star) NA
REPAIR TRUCK TANKS
(WATER & FUEL),
REPAIR FUEL FORM AT
Equipment Manufacturer's: GARAGE LOCATION, NA NA NA NA

REPAIR LEAKS IN
EQUIPMENT, FUEL
METER CALIBARTIONS.




BID TABULATION

ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

12 13
BIG MOE SPRING & BIRMINGHAM
DESCRIPTION ALIGNMENT OF |RUBBER & GASKET

BIRMINGHAM, INC.

COMPANY INC.

MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK

CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this
category

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT

NA% WITH $24 MAX

SECTION A-1 |2- Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NO BID NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $120.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $120.00
SECTION A-2 |3, Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 10% NO BID

SECTION A-3

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT

NO BID

NO BID

SECTION A-4

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

NO BID

NO BID
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DESCRIPTION

12

BIG MOE SPRING &
ALIGNMENT OF
BIRMINGHAM, INC

13

BIRMINGHAM
RUBBER & GASKET
COMPANY INC.

NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic) $120.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $120.00
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 10

SECTION A-5 NA% WITH $24 MAX NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
NA
5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star) NA
Equipment Manufacturer's: NA NA




BID TABULATION

ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

20 DISCOUNT OFF LIST

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT

5% WITH $25 MAX

14 15 16 17
CAHABA TRACTOR | CAPITAL TRACTOR CARL CANNON
DESCRIPTION BRADY - KILMURY CDJR '
v cbJ CO. INC. CHEVROLET
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands In this
category $120.00 $175.00
SECTION A-1 |2- Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $125.00 NO BID NO BID $175.00
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 20 DISCOUNT OFF LIST 25% OFF LIST
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 5% WITH $25 MAX 12% WITH $25 MAX
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $120.00 $195.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $125.00 $195.00
SECTION A-2 NO BID NO BID 25% OFF LIST

12% WITH $25 MAX

SECTION A-3

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$175.00

$175.00

25% OFF LIST

12% WITH $25 MAX

SECTION A-4

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

NO BID

$148.00

$155 SHOP / $175 FIELD

$195.00

$148.00

$155 SHOP / $175 FIELD

$195.00

10% OFF DEALER LIST

5% DISCOUNT OFF MSRP

25% OFF LIST

2% OFF $40 MAX

NA

12% WITH $25 MAX
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14 15 16 17
CAHABA TRACTOR | CAPITAL TRACTOR, CARL CANNON
DESCRIPTION BRADY - KILMURY CDJR co. INC. CHEVROLET
NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic) $175.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $175.00
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 25%
SECTION A-5 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 12% WITH $25 MAX
NA
5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star) NA
Equipment Manufacturer's: NA NA NA NA

10




BID TABULATION

ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

18

DESCRIPTION

Chevrolet Bessemer

MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK

CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)

SECTION A-1

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this
category

89.95

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

99.95

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

10% DISCOUNT OFF LIST

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS

10% WITH $25 MAX

SECTION A-2

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category

89.95

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

99.95

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

10% DISCOUNT OFF LIST

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

10% WITH $25 MAX

ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

SECTIONA-3 3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NOBID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
SECTION A-4 NO BID



mailto:lindseyc@jccal.org

| 18

DESCRIPTION Chevrolet Bessemer

NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic)

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

SECTION A-5 NO BID

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star)

Equipment Manufacturer's: NA

12



BID TABULATION

ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT

19 20 21 22 23
DESCRIPTION E(S:L?I?DIII/IEI;\II\-II—'I'Z& COWIN DANA SAFETY DEWEY BARBER EDWARDS
PARTS CO. EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, INC CHEVROLET CHEVROLET
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands In this
category $50.00 $150.00
SECTION A-1 |2 Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NO BID NO BID NO BID $75.00 $150.00
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 2504 10%
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 10% WITH $10 MAX NA
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
SECTION A-2 |3, parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
SECTION A-3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SECTION A-4

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $130.00 $186.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $130.00 $186.00
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 0 0

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

4% WITH $125 MAX

5% WITH $600 MAX

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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19 20 21 22 23
DESCRIPTION E(():L(J)I??III/IESI\-II:I'Z& COWIN DANA SAFETY DEWEY BARBER EDWARDS
PARTS CO. EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, INC CHEVROLET CHEVROLET
NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic) $130.00 $186.00 $105.00

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $130.00 $186.00 $105.00

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 0 0 12%-40% OFF MSRP

SECTION A-5 NO BID NO BID

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 4% WITH $125 MAX 5% WITH $600 MAX NA

5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA NA NA

6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star) NA NA NA

Equipment Manufacturer's: NA NA NA NA

NA

14




BID TABULATION

ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT

12% WITH $25 MAX

24 25 26 27 28
GOOCH PAINT & |GOODYEAR TIRE &
DESCRIPTION FLEETPRIDE FF RADIATOR H & R AGRIPOWER
GO = BODY INC. RUBBER COMPANY & G ©
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this
category
SECTION A-1 |2 Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
SECTION A-2 |3, Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $155.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $155.00
SECTION A-3 - - - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 50%

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $150.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $150.00
SECTION A-4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10%

8% WITH $80 MAX
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24 25 26 27 28
GOOCH PAINT & |GOODYEAR TIRE &
DESCRIPTION
SC 0] FLEETPRIDE GOFF RADIATOR BODY INC. RUBBER COMPANY H & R AGRIPOWER
NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic) $155.00 $135.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $155.00 $135.00
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 50% 10%
NO BID
SECTION A-5 NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 12% WITH $25 MAX 5% WITH $25 MAX
5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA NA
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star) NA NA
ALL MAKES AND MODELS
HEAVY DUTY FLEET SERVICE $80
COMMERICAL TRUCK PER HOUR ROAD
Equipment Manufacturer's: AND TRAILER REPAIR NA NA SERVICE $95 PER NA

"ON HIGHWAY"
SHOP IS NOT LICENSED
FOR ANY BRAND
SPECIFIC REPAIRS

HOUR (DURING
REGULAR HOURS)
$142.50 AFTER HOURS

16




BID TABULATION

ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT

10% WITH $25 MAX

29 30 31
HUNTSVILLE
DESCRIPTION e DI('?\I%BS GO TRACTOR & SUIIL\I/IDTIEIIE?SIAI}LC
; EQUIPMENT '
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands In this
category $155.00
SECTION A-1 |2- Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $155.00 NO BID NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 10%
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 10% WITH $25 MAX
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $155.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $155.00
SECTION A-2 3, parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 10% NO BID NO BID

SECTION A-3

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category NA $125.00

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NA $125.00

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 10% 0%

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum NA 2% WITH $25 MAX

OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT

NO BID

SECTION A-4

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category NA $125.00

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NA $125.00

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 10% 10%

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum NA 2% WITH $25 MAX

NO BID
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29 30 31
HUNTSVILLE
DESCRIPTION HULL DS\IBCBS FORD TRACTOR & SUIIL\I/IDTIEESIAI}LC
' EQUIPMENT '
NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic) $125.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $125.00
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 0
SECTION A-5 NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 0
5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star) NA
Equipment Manufacturer's: NS NA NA
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BID TABULATION

ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

32

33

34

35

DESCRIPTION

INGRAM EQUIPMENT CO.,

IVM SOLUTIONS D/B/A

KNAPHEIDE TRUCK

KURTS TRUCK &

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT

11.5% of Labor with $25 Max.

5% WITH $25 MAX

10% WITH $1000 MAX

LLC "ROADSIDE INC.* EQUIPMENT PARTS CO. INC.
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands In this
category
SECTION A-1 |2 Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
SECTION A-2 |3, Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NO BOD NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $144.00 $125.00 $145.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $144.00 $125.00 $145.00
SECTION A-3 - - - NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 20% Discount List 0 10*

SECTION A-4

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category

$144.00

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

$144.00

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

20% Discount List

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

11.5% of Labor with $25 Max.

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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DESCRIPTION

32

INGRAM EQUIPMENT CO.,

33

IVM SOLUTIONS D/B/A

34

KNAPHEIDE TRUCK

35

KURTS TRUCK &

LLC "ROADSIDE INC." EQUIPMENT PARTS CO. INC.
NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic) $145.00 $119.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $145.00 $119.00
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 10% 30%
SECTION A-5 NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 10% WITH $1000 MAX NA
5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA NA
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star) NA NA
KENWORTH, PETERBOILT,
INTERNATIONAL,
Heil, Tymco, Vac-Con, Pac-Mac, FREIGHTLINER, MACK,
American Road Machinery, Bayne, STERLING, FORD, GMC,
Barker, Curoho, Cur-A-Lift, Pioneer, ISUZU, VOLVO, HINE,
O'Brian, Donavan, Galbreath, Stellar, WESTERN STAR,
Piperhunter,STEPP, Auto Crane,
Equipment Manufacturer's: DaKota. NA NA

By contract with the above
manufacturers, Ingram Equipment
Co., LLC is authorized and certified
to provide the subject repairs and
parts on the listed equipment.
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BID TABULATION

ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT

36 37 38 39
MONTAGE NORSTAR
DESCRIPTION ISR TN ENTERPRISES| INDUSTRIES, NOVA-TEC
AND SERVICE
INC. INC.
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this
category NA
SECTION A-1 |2 Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NO BID NO BID NO BID NA
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 20%
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum NA
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category NA
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NA
SECTION A-2 |3, Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NO BID NO BID NO BID 20%
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum NA

SECTION A-3

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

SECTION A-4

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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36 37 38 39

MONTAGE NORSTAR

DESCRIPTION SIS ENy rlixiz ENTERPRISES | INDUSTRIES, NOVA-TEC
AND SERVICE
INC. INC.
NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic) $135.00 $100.00 NA
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $135.00 $100.00 NA
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA 10% OFF $150.00 20%
SECTION A-5 NO BID

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 25% WITH $25 MAX VARIES NA

DISCOUNT

VARIES LABOR

5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA $150.00 NA
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star) NA $150.00 NA
Equipment Manufacturer's: NA NA NA NA
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BID TABULATION

ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT

40 41 42 43 44
PANAR
. P & H SUPPLY CO.
DESCRIPTION OHRSUEDFate) [atTIn OIS INC./RUMFOLA PIRTEK HOOVER [ S& HGLASSCO. LLC
PARTS TOWING & SALES & SERVICE
RECOVERY LLC
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands In this
category $130.00
SECTION A-1 |2 Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NO BID $130.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum NA
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $180.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $180.00
SECTION A-2 |3, Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NO BID NA NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum NA
ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
SECTION A-3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SECTION A-4

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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40 41 42 43 44
PARKER
. P & H SUPPLY CO.
DESCRIPTION O'REILLY AUTO| AUTOMOTIVE INC./RUMFOLA PIRTEK HOOVER [ S& HGLASSCO. LLC
PARTS TOWING & SALES & SERVICE
RECOVERY LLC
NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic) $180.00 $120.00 NA
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $180.00 $120.00 NA
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA 15% OFF LIST SHEET NA
SECTION A-5 NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum NA 0% NA
(A.) 50% OFF LIST (B.)
$12,000 LABOR RATE (C.)
5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA NA MISCELLANEOUS $15.00
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star) NA NA $50.00
CATEPILLAR, FORD, CHRYSLER,
KOMATSU, JOHN
KENWORTH, MAC,
DEERE, VOLVO, INTERNATIONAL
Equipment Manufacturer's: NA NA NA LIEBHERR, FREIGHTLINER '
SENNEEBAGEN, '

BOBCAT, TAKEUCHI,
KUMBOTA, YALE

CHEVROLET, NISSAN,
TOYOTA, VOLVO
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BID TABULATION

ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT

45 46 47
SANSOM SOUTHLAND
DESCRIPTION EQUIPMENT SOUT'UIiRR'_\II_TIRE TRANSPORTATION
COMPANY GROUP
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands In this
category
SECTION A-1 |2 Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $190.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $190.00
SECTION A-2 NO BID NO BID 25% OFF LIST

10% WITH $25 MAX

SECTION A-3

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $150.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $150.00
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 10%

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT

5% WITH $25 MAX

NO BID

NO BID

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category NA
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $145.00
SECTION A-4 NO BID NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA
NA
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45 46 47
SANSOM SOUTHLAND
DESCRIPTION EQUIPMENT SOUTS&F;I_\IFTIRE TRANSPORTATION
COMPANY GROUP
NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic) $150.00 0 NA
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $150.00 $95.00 NA
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 0% 0% NA
5% OF LABOR WITH
SECTION A-5 $25 MAX. NA NA
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
10% DISCOUNT, LABOR
NA NA 0.00
5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) RATE $50.
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star) NA NA $40.00
Equipment Manufacturer's: NA NA NA
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BID TABULATION

ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

0

17% WITH $25 MAX

5.5% WITH $298 MAX

48 49 50 51
DESCRIPTION STEEL CITY WELDING STIVERS FORD OF THOMPSON TRACTOR | TOWN & COUNTRY
& REPAIR INC. BIRMINGHAM COMPANY FORD
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this
category $149.95 $165.00
SECTION A-1 |2 Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NO BID $149.95 NO BID $185.00

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 35% 25%

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 17% WITH $25 MAX 2% WITH $35 MAX
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $179.95 $157 RT/$235 OT $185.00

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $179.95 $157 RT / $235 OT $225.00

SECTION A-2 |3, Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NO BID 35% 0 25%%

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 17% WITH $25 MAX 5.5% WITH $298 MAX 2% WITH $35 MAX
ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $149.95

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $149.95

SECTION A-3 - - - NO BID NO BID NO BID

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 35%

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 17% WITH $25 MAX
. __________________________|
OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $179.95 $148 RT/$222 OT

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $179.95 $148 RT / $222 OT

SECTION A-4 NO BID NO BID
35%
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DESCRIPTION

48

STEEL CITY WELDING

49

STIVERS FORD OF

50

THOMPSON TRACTOR

51

TOWN & COUNTRY

& REPAIR INC. BIRMINGHAM COMPANY FORD
NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic) NA $149.95

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $90.00 $149.95

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 0 35%
SECTION A-5 0 17% WITH $25 MAX NO BID NO BID

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

NA 35% OFF LIST / LABOR
5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) RATE $150, MISC COST $35
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star) NA $100
Equipment Manufacturer's: NA NA NA NA
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ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

52 53
TPH HOLDINGS, LLC TRACTOR &
DESCRIPTION D/B/A THE PARTS EQUIPMENT
HOUSE COMPANY
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this
category
SECTION A-1 2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NO BID NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
SECTION A-2 3. Pparts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NO BID NO BID

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
. ______________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________}

ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
SECTION A-3 - - - NO BID NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $147 SHOP $161 FIELD

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $147 SHOP $161 FIELD
SECTION A-4 NO BID

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 0

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 10% WITH $125 MAX
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52 53
TPH HOLDINGS, LLC TRACTOR &
DESCRIPTION D/B/A THE PARTS EQUIPMENT
HOUSE COMPANY
NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic)
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
SECTION A-5 NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star)
OEM LICENSED
DISTRIBUTOR FOR
KOMATREE, VOGALE,
Equipment Manufacturer's: NA HAM, WIRTGEM,

GRADALL, FECON,
KLEEMAN CRUSHERS,
LEE BOY, ROSCO,
SCHWARGE, TRAMAC
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ITB 66-23 "FLEET VEHICLE REPAIR AND PARTS"
CHARLES LINDSEY, PRINCIPAL BUYER
lindseyc@jccal.org

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT

54 55 56 57
TRUCKWORX- VOYLES CHRYSLER
DESCRIPTION EQJIITDII\SI‘EII\EIEI\II_LC KENWORTH OF CSEI':JISSSI\(QIIL_II_I\IIEC DODGE JEEP RAM
BIRMINGHAM OF BIRMINGHAM
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands In this
category $164.95
SECTION A-1 |2 Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NO BID NO BID NO BID $164.95
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 0
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 8% WITH $25 MAX
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $150.00 $164.95
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $150.00 $164.95
SECTION A-2 |3, Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NO BID 25% NO BID 0
10% OF LABOR WITH $25
MAX 8% WITH $25 MAX

SECTION A-3

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT

NO BID

NA

NA

25% DISCOUNT OF LIST

NA

NO BID

NO BID

SECTION A-4

1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category

$130 SHOP / $150 FIELD

2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)

$130 SHOP / $150 FIELD

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

10% OFF LIST

4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum

3% WITH $25.00 MAX

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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54 55 56 57
TRUCKWORX- VOYLES CHRYSLER
DESCRIPTION EQl-JrIFIQDII\(jFEQE'IIE'I\II_LC KENWORTH OF C;EEISSSI\(SII\II_II'EC DODGE JEEP RAM
BIRMINGHAM ' OF BIRMINGHAM
NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic) $130 SHOP / $150 FIELD NA
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $130 SHOP / $150 FIELD NA

3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)

10% OFF LIST

25% DISCOUNT OFF LIST

SECTION A-5 NA NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum 3% WITH $25.00 MAX
NA NA
5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star) NA NA
Equipment Manufacturer's: NA NA NA NA
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58 59
WARREN TRUCK |WARRIOR TRACTOR
DESCRIPTION AND TRAILER INC. | & EQUIPMENT CO.
(ALABAMA) INC.
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR NON-BODY WORK
CARS/LIGHT TRUCKS (INCLUDING SUV'S)
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for *OEM diagnostic services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this
category
SECTION A-1 2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) NO BID NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
SUPER DUTY TRUCKS/VANS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs)
SECTION A-2 3. Pparts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NO BID NO BID
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
0 ___________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________
ENVIRONMENTAL EQUIPMENT
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $140.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $140.00
SECTION A-3 - - - NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum NA
OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour for services by a licensed dealer or business that can repair and diagnose various brands in this category $140.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $140.00
SECTION A-4 NO BID
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) NA
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum NA
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58 59
WARREN TRUCK |WARRIOR TRACTOR
DESCRIPTION AND TRAILER INC. | & EQUIPMENT CO.
(ALABAMA) INC.
NON OEM SERVICES/VENDORS
1. Alabama Standard Labor rate/hour (Diagnoistic) $100.00 $140.00
2. Hourly Labor Rate (Repairs) $100.00 $140.00
3. Parts, Catalog Price (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) 10% OFF LIST NA
SECTION A-5 5% OF $25 MAX NA
4. Miscellaneous Shop Supplies (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.) Must not Exceed $25/Maximum
NA NA
5. Windshield Replacement (based on sheet used, list cost, jobber, etc.)
6. Windshield Repair (Chipped or Star) NA NA
Equipment Manufacturer's: NA NA
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